
PERSPECTIVES by Todd White

Activities of broader public market players are increasingly relevant to 
the public crypto market sphere. This is of course no surprise, as we 
have long believed the distinction between traditional finance and the 
crypto/digital asset sectors will diminish over time, with crypto and its 
core technology inevitably becoming an integrated component of 
global financial and capital markets. This is true on both the 
speculative side, as investors seek the ability to allocate to 
crypto-based investment as an asset class, and on the infrastructure 
side, with blockchain-based technologies poised to permeate the 
inner workings of global finance.

This week saw two such moves from players outside our core public 
crypto index that will likely reverberate for the companies we cover. 
Interactive Brokers (NASDAQ: IBKR), the tech-enabled online trading 
and custody platform, has formally partnered with Zero Hash, a 
"crypto-as-as-service" company that embeds digital asset trading 
into existing customer trading interfaces. The partnership will give 
IBKR clients access to Zero Hash accounts to trade BTC, ETH, BCH 
and LTC directly through IBKR's platform.  Zero Hash's API-enabled 
integration seems purpose-built for the popular fintech trading 
platform, perhaps unsurprising after IBKR's participation in Zero 
Hash's 2021 Series D investment round.

On the infrastructure side, Citi (NYSE: C) launched "Citi Token 
Services" on Monday, using a permissioned private blockchain 
offering programmable, 24-7 tools for trade finance and cash 
management to institutional clients.  The services were piloted on the 
trade finance side by using tokenized deposits and smart contracts to 
give Maersk an instant settlement solution with a canal authority - 
similar to a traditional bank guarantee/letter of credit facility, but 
without the friction of cut-off times and gaps in the service window - 
and will also target corporate treasurers with tools to manage global 
liquidity on a just-in-time, programmable basis.  
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